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TRACT BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
1-24 Country Forest Products Flannel Fleet Al Mann Logging Schreiner Forestry Kleinschmidt Logging
Mixed Hardwood 4" 1350 Tons $12.00 $11.00 $7.50 $15.00 $15.00
Red Oak 4" 490 Tons $6.00 $11.00 $7.50 $6.00 $5.00
Aspen 4" 30 Tons $6.00 $11.00 $7.50 $6.00 $12.00
Red Oak Logs 100 MBF $415.00 $325.00 $220.00 $300.00 $300.00
Red Maple Logs 90 MBF $295.00 $220.00 $220.00 $200.00 $150.00
Ash Logs 15 MBF $205.00 $210.00 $220.00 $200.00 $150.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs 4 MBF $150.00 $200.00 $220.00 $200.00 $150.00
Tops/Biomass 600 Tons

TOTAL $91,045.00 TOTAL $76,820.00 TOTAL $60,005.00 TOTAL $75,170.00 TOTAL $69,410.00 

1-24 #Smola Enterprises *Twin Forest Products ^Welter Forest Products Northwest Hwd Tigerton Lumber
Mixed Hardwood 4" 1350 Tons $18.40 $23.00 $2.10 $15.00 $8.10
Red Oak 4" 490 Tons $8.00 $14.70 $2.10 $9.00 $8.10
Aspen 4" 30 Tons $12.15 $12.00 $1.00 $7.00 $8.10
Red Oak Logs 100 MBF $475.00 $460.00 $200.00 $425.00 $410.00
Red Maple Logs 90 MBF $475.00 $360.00 $450.00 $300.00 $410.00
Ash Logs 15 MBF no bid $210.00 $175.00 $250.00 $250.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs 4 MBF $475.00 $360.00 $175.00 $200.00 $200.00
Tops/Biomass 600 Tons

TOTAL $121,274.50 TOTAL $121,603.00 TOTAL $67,719.00 TOTAL $98,920.00 TOTAL $97,597.00 

1-24 #Midwest Hardwood
Mixed Hardwood 4" 1350 Tons $14.14
Red Oak 4" 490 Tons $10.97
Aspen 4" 30 Tons no bid
Red Oak Logs 100 MBF $315.00
Red Maple Logs 90 MBF $315.00
Ash Logs 15 MBF $275.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs 4 MBF $300.00
Tops/Biomass 600 Tons

TOTAL $89,639.30 TOTAL $ TOTAL $ TOTAL $ TOTAL $ 

2-24 Al Mann Logging Bell Timber *TNT Timber Javorek Logging Biewer
Red Pine 4" 2450 Tons $8.00 $25.22 $34.05 $26.78 $32.32
Tops/Biomass 500 Tons

TOTAL $19,600.00 TOTAL $61,789.00 TOTAL $83,422.50 TOTAL $65,611.00 TOTAL $79,184.00

*Awarded
^bid rejected - no 10% bid bond 
#bid rejected - no bid on one or more species
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3-24 Al Mann Logging Bell Timber Javorek Logging *Kleinschmidt Logging Biewer
Red Pine 4" 800 Tons $2.25 $11.91 $9.27 $17.25 $15.17

TOTAL $1,800.00 TOTAL $9,528.00 TOTAL $7,416.00 TOTAL $13,800.00 TOTAL $12,136.00 

4-24 Schreiner Forestry Flannel Fleet Logging #Al Mann Logging Twin Forest Products *Smola Enterprises
Red Oak 4" 1100 Tons $6.00 $11.00 $5.80 $11.50 $13.61
Mixed Hardwood 4" 850 Tons $14.50 $10.00 $6.25 $18.50 $19.20
Aspen 4" 550 Tons $6.00 $11.00 $6.25 $19.50 $12.00
Basswood 4" 80 Tons $1.00 $2.00 $6.25 $1.00 $5.00
Red Oak Logs 75.0 MBF $400.00 $325.00 no bid $400.00 $475.00
Red Maple Logs 20.0 MBf $340.00 $210.00 $160.00 $400.00 $475.00
Hard Maple Logs 20.0 MBF $300.00 $325.00 $160.00 $500.00 $475.00
Ash Logs 7.0 MBF $285.00 $160.00 $160.00 $200.00 $425.00
Basswood Logs 4.0 MBF $170.00 $120.00 $160.00 $150.00 $220.00

TOTAL $67,780.00 TOTAL $63,485.00 TOTAL $23,790.00 TOTAL $89,180.00 TOTAL $96,771.00

4-24 Kleinschmidt Logging
Red Oak 4" 1100 Tons $5.00
Mixed Hardwood 4" 850 Tons $15.00
Aspen 4" 550 Tons $12.00
Basswood 4" 80 Tons $4.00
Red Oak Logs 75.0 MBF $300.00
Red Maple Logs 20.0 MBf $150.00
Hard Maple Logs 20.0 MBF $300.00
Ash Logs 7.0 MBF $150.00
Basswood Logs 4.0 MBF $100.00

TOTAL $58,120.00 TOTAL $ TOTAL $ TOTAL $ TOTAL $

5-24 Schreiner Forestry Al Mann Logging #Smola Enterprises *Kleinschmidt Logging
Aspen 4" 2350 Tons $9.00 $7.81 $6.50 $12.75
Mixed Hardwood 4" 210 Tons $12.00 $7.81 $6.50 $15.00
Red Oak 4" 55 Tons $6.00 $7.81 $6.50 $5.00
Red Oak Logs 7.0 MBF $180.00 $400.00 no bid $350.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs 1.0 MBF $180.00 $400.00 no bid $225.00
Tops/Biomass 650 Tons

TOTAL $25,440.00 TOTAL $23,623.15 TOTAL $16,997.50 TOTAL $36,062.50 TOTAL $

*Awarded
^bid rejected - no 10% bid bond
#bid rejected - no bid on one or more species
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