
Marathon County Forestry September 30, 2024 Bid Opening

6-24 5 Name --> Flannel Fleet Logging  Country Forest Products  Yoder Lumber Smola Enterprises  Flannel Fleet Logging 
 Welter Forest 

Products 

Product Pulp/Ton MBF  Minimum 
 no bid bond - rejected 

Red Mpl 102  $                        280.00  $                               300.00  $                        450.00 350.00$                           $                        280.00  $                        250.00 

Red Oak 39  $                        325.00  $                               300.00  $                        450.00 350.00$                           $                        325.00  $                        200.00 

Ash 8  $                        160.00  $                               300.00  $                        100.00 275.00$                           $                        160.00  $                        150.00 

Bass Wood 1  $                        140.00  $                               100.00  $                        100.00 100.00$                           $                        140.00  $                        150.00 

Bass Wood 40  $                            6.00  $                                   2.00  $                            1.00 1.00$                               $                            6.00  $                            1.00 

Red Oak 625  $                          14.00  $                                   4.50  $                            2.00 3.00$                               $                          14.00  $                            2.57 

Aspen 825  $                          14.00  $                                 10.50  $                            1.00 8.00$                               $                          14.00  $                            3.10 

Mx Hdw 2150  $                          14.00  $                                 10.50  $                            2.00 13.00$                             $                          14.00  $                            3.10 

Top/Bio 1100

Totals 4740 150 93,295.00$                   78,930.00$                         70,765.00$                   88,115.00$                    93,295.00$                   45,518.75$                   -$                               -$                           

7-24 2 Name -->  Flannel Fleet Logging  Flannel Fleet Logging  Smola Enterprises 

Product Pulp/Ton MBF  Minimum 

Red Maple 17  $                        210.00  $                               210.00  $                        100.00 

Aspen 3150  $                            6.50  $                                   6.50  $                            2.50 

Mx Hdw 750  $                            6.50  $                                   6.50  $                            2.50 

Top/Bio 1000

Totals 4900 17 28,920.00$                   28,920.00$                         11,450.00$                   -$                                -$                               -$                               -$                               -$                           

8-24 6 Name -->  Midwest Hardwood  Country Forest Products  Smola Enterprises  Flannel Fleet Logging 
 Welter Forest 

Products 
 Yoder Lumber  Midwest Hardwood 

Product Pulp/Ton MBF  Minimum  no bid bond - rejected 

Basswood 52  $                        100.00  $                               125.00  $                          75.00  $                          140.00  $                               150.00  $                               100.00  $                               100.00 

Hard Maple 44  $                        552.00  $                               300.00  $                        275.00  $                          350.00  $                               300.00  $                               350.00  $                               552.00 

Red Oak 4  $                        301.00  $                               300.00  $                        275.00  $                          325.00  $                               200.00  $                               350.00  $                               301.00 

Red Maple 64  $                        349.00  $                               300.00  $                        275.00  $                          210.00  $                               250.00  $                               350.00  $                               349.00 

Ash 29  $                        249.00  $                               200.00  $                        275.00  $                          160.00  $                               150.00  $                               100.00  $                               249.00 

Mx Hdw 2100  $                          12.52  $                                   8.00  $                            8.00  $                            12.00  $                                    3.10  $                                    2.00  $                                  12.52 

Basswood 260  $                            2.33  $                                   2.00  $                            1.00  $                              6.00  $                                    0.50  $                                    1.00  $                                    2.33 

Red Oak 25  $                          12.52  $                                   2.00  $                            1.00  $                            11.00  $                                    3.00  $                                    2.00  $                                  12.52 

Top/Bio 725



Marathon County Forestry September 30, 2024 Bid Opening

Totals 3110 193 87,459.80$                   63,270.00$                         59,760.00$                   69,095.00$                    48,865.00$                   51,810.00$                   87,459.80$                   -$                           

9-24 3 Name --> Flannel Fleet Logging  Country Forest Products Smola Enterprises Flannel Fleet Logging

Product Pulp/Tns MBF  Minimum 

Red Maple 96 210.00$                        200.00$                               200.00$                        210.00$                          

Ash 13 200.00$                        150.00$                               200.00$                        200.00$                          

Mx Hdw 2650 6.50$                             6.00$                                    6.25$                             6.50$                              

Top/Bio 800

Totals 3450 109 39,985.00$                   37,050.00$                         38,362.50$                   39,985.00$                    -$                               -$                               -$                               -$                           

10-24 3 Name --> Flannel Fleet Logging  Country Forest Products Flannel Fleet Logging Yoder Lumber

Product Pulp/Tns MBF  Minimum  no bid bond - rejected 

Basswod 48 140.00$                         $                               150.00 140.00$                        100.00$                          

Ash 38 200.00$                         $                               250.00 200.00$                        100.00$                          

Hard Maple 18 350.00$                         $                               350.00 350.00$                        450.00$                          

Red Maple 11 280.00$                         $                               350.00 280.00$                        450.00$                          

Hickory 2 160.00$                         $                               150.00 160.00$                        400.00$                          

Mx Hdw 1550 13.00$                           $                                 10.00 13.00$                          2.00$                              

Basswood 700 6.00$                              $                                   2.00 6.00$                             1.00$                              

Aspen 260 14.00$                           $                                 10.00 14.00$                          -$                                

Hickory 90 13.00$                           $                                 10.00 13.00$                          2.00$                              

Totals 2600 117 53,180.00$                   47,550.00$                         53,180.00$                   26,430.00$                    -$                               -$                               -$                               -$                           

no bid on aspen


	Bids

